BID REPLY FORM - PRINTSHOP PAPER - May 31, 2024
(Prices must be held firm through December 31, 2024)
3 l
VENDOR: GARVEY'S ' GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS VENDOR: LINDENMEYR MONROE VENDOR: VERITIV OPERATING COMPANY VENDOR: OFFICE 8
# of # of # of # of
Item Estimated| Estimated | Sheets Item Estimated| Estimated | Sheets Item Estimated| Estimated | Sheets Item Estimated| Estimated | Sheets
# Item Size Brand Bid Price | Usage Cost Per Case # Item Size Brand Bid Price | Usage Cost Per Case # Item Size Brand Bid Price | Usage Cost Per Case # Item Size Brand Bid Price| Usage Cost Per Case
1 |Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb. | 8.5x11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x11" | Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x11" | Boise Fireworx |NO BID 70
Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x 11" Domtar Colors $63.90 70 $4,473.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. | 8.5x 11" Domtar Colors 70 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x11" | Domtar Colors 70 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x11" | Domtar Colors 70
Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill
Colors, 20lb.| 85x11" Colors 70 Colors, 20lb. | 8.5x11" Colors $62.40 70 $4,368.00 5000 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x 11" Colors $63.25 70 $4,427.50 5000 Colors, 20lb.| 8.5x 11" Colors 70
2 |[Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" Boise Fireworx 30 2 Colors, 20lb. | 11x17" Boise Fireworx 30 2 | Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" | Boise Fireworx 30 2 [ Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" | Boise Fireworx [NO BID 30
Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" Domtar Colors $70.00 30 $2,100.00 2500 Colors, 20lb. | 11x 17" Domtar Colors 30 Colors, 20lb.| 11x 17" Domtar Colors 30 Colors, 20lb.| 11x 17" Domtar Colors 30
Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill
Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" Colors 30 Colors, 20lb. | 11x17" Colors $67.55 30 $2,026.50 2500 Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" Colors $67.25 30 $2,017.50 2500 Colors, 20lb.| 11x17" Colors 30
Neenah Neenah Neenah Neenah
3 |60lb.Colors| 8.5x11" Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60 Ib. Colors | 8.5x11" Astrobrights $135.90 25 $3,397.50 5000 3 | 60lb.Colors| 85x11" Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60lb.Colors| 85x11" Astrobrights |NO BID 25
Neenah Neenah Neenah ; Neenah
4 |60Ib.Colors| 11x17" Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 60 Ib. Colors | 11x17" Astrobrights $135.90 10 $1,359.00 2500 4 60Ib.Colors| 11x17" Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 601lb.Colors| 11x17" Astrobrights |NO BID 10
| i ‘ | ‘ i ‘ . z ‘ ‘ . ‘
5 |501Ib Colors i 8.5x 11" Exact Brights $150.00 30 $4,500.00 5000 5 | 501IbColors | 8.5x11" Exact Brights $163.50 30 $4,905.00 5000 5 |50IbColors| 85x11" | ExactBrights |NO BID 30 5 501Ib Colors| 8.5x 11" Exact Brights |NO BID 30
6 |241b. White| 8.5x11" Polaris $64.99 10 $649.90 5000 6 24 Ib. White | 8.5x 11" Polaris 10 6 |241b. White| 8.5x 11" Polaris NO BID 10 6 241b. White| 8.5x 11" Polaris NO BID 10
60 Ib. White| 8.5x11" Cougar ‘ 10 60 Ib. White | 8.5x 11" Cougar $82.40 10 $824.00 5000 60 |Ib. White| 8.5x 11" Cougar 10 60 Ib. White | 8.5x 11" Cougar 10
7 |241b.White| 11x17" Polaris $77.95 10 $779.50 2500 7 | 241b.White | 11x17" Polaris 10 7 24lb. White| 11x17" Polaris  |NO BID 10 7 241b. White| 11x17" Polaris  |NO BID 10
60 Ib. White| 11x17" Cougar ‘ 10 60 Ib. White | 11x17" Cougar $86.95 10 $869.50 2500 60 Ib. White | 11x17" Cougar 10 60 Ib. White| 11x17" Cougar 10
Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum
8 |67 lb. White| 8.5x11" Bristol $80.00 40 $3,200.00 2000 8 67 lb. White | 8.5x 11" Bristol 40 8 | 67Ilb. White| 85x11" Bristol 40 8 67Ib. White| 85x11" Bristol NO BID 40
67 Ib. White| 8.5x11" Springhill 40 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 11" Springhill $48.24_ 407 $1,929.60 2000 67 Ib. White| 8.5x11" Springhill $51.20 40 $2,048.00 2000 67 Ib. White| 8.5x11" Springhill 40
67 lb. White| 8.5x11" Domtar 40 67 lb. White | 8.5x 11" Domtar : 40 67 lb. White | 8.5x 11" Domtar 40 67 Ib. White| 8.5x 11" Domtar 40
Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum
9 |67 Ilb. White| 8.5x14" Bristol NO BID 25 9 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Bristol $99.78 25 $2,494.50 2000 9 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Bristol NO BID 25 9 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Bristol NO BID 25
67 lb. White| 8.5x 14" Springhill 25 67 lb. White | 8.5x 14" Springhill 25 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Springhill 25 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Springhill 25
67 Ib. White| 8.5x 14" Domtar 25 67 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Domtar 25 67 Ib. White| 8.5x 14" Domtar 25 67 Ib. White| 8.5x 14" Domtar 25
Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum
10 |67 lb. White| 11x17" Bristol NO BID 40 10 | 67 Ib. White | 11x17" Bristol | | 40 10 | 67Ib. White| 11x 17" Bristol 40 10 |67 b. White| 11x 17" Bristol NO BID 40
67 lb. White| 11x17" Springhill 40 67 lb. White | 11x17" Springhill $51.00 40 $2,040.00 1000 67 lb. White | 11x17" Springhill $55.50 40 $2,220.00 1000 67 Ib. White| 11x17" Springhill 40
67 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar 40 67 Ib. White | 11x17" Domtar l 40 } 2 67 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar 40 67 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar 40
Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum
11 |67 |b.Colors| 8.5x11" Bristol 20 11 |67 Ib.Colors | 8.5x11" Bristol 20 11 67 Ib.Colors| 85x11" Bristol 20 11 67 Ib.Colors| 85x11" Bristol NO BID 20
67 Ib. Colors| 8.5x11" Springhill $104.00 20 $2,080.00 2000 67 Ib. Colors | 8.5x 11" Springhill $51.86 20  $1,037.20 2000 67 Ib. Colors| 8.5x 11" Springhill $53.20 20 $1,064.00 2000 67 Ib. Colors| 8.5x 11" Springhill 20
67 Ib. Colors| 8.5x11" Domtar 20 67 Ib. Colors | 8.5x 11" Domtar t 5 20 } E 67 Ib. Colors| 85x11" Domtar 20 67 Ib. Colors| 8.5x11" Domtar 20
Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum Exact Vellum
12 |67 |b.Colors| 11x17" Bristol NO BID 10 12 | 671lb.Colors | 11x17" Bristol 10 12 67 Ib.Colors| 11x17" Bristol 10 12 67 Ib.Colors| 11x17" Bristol NO BID 10
67 lb. Colors| 11x17" Springhill 10 67 Ib. Colors | 11x17" Springhill 10‘ 67 Ib. Colors| 11x17" Springhill $57.80 10 $578.00 1000 67 Ib. Colors| 11x17" Springhill 10
67 Ib. Colors| 11x17" Domtar 10 67 Ib. Colors | 11x17" Domtar $54.60 10 $546.00 1000 67 Ib. Colors| 11x17" Domtar 10 67 Ib. Colors| 11x 17" Domtar 10
13 White 8.5x 11" Exact Index $96.00 75 $7,200.00 2000 13 |110Ib. White; 8.5x 11" Exact Index l 5 ‘ ; 13 White 8.5x 11" Exact Index 75 13 White 8.5x 11" Exact Index |NO BID 75
White 8.5x 11" Springhill Index 75 110 Ib. White| 8.5x 11" | Springhill Index $64.00 75  $4,800.00 2000 White 8.5x 11" | Springhill Index $66.80 75 $5,010.00 2000 White 8.5x 11" | Springhill Index 75
White 8.5x11" Domtar 75 110 lb. White| 8.5x 11" Domtar ! 75 ‘ g White 8.5x 11" Domtar 75 White 8.5x 11" Domtar 75
14 White 11x17" Exact Index $140.00 30 $4,200.00 1000 14 |110Ib. White|, 11x17" Exact Index ‘ 30 ‘ g 14 White 11x17" Exact Index 30 14 White 11x17" Exact Index |NO BID 30
White 11x17" Springhill Index 30 110 Ib. White| 11x17" Springhill Index $67.00 30 $2,010.00 1000 White 11x 17" | Springhill Index $71.60 30 $2,148.00 1000 White 11x 17" | Springhill Index 30
White 11x17" Domtar 30 110 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar f ] 30 } % White 11x17" Domtar 30 White 11x17" Domtar 30
15 Colors 85x 11" Exact Index $120.00 25 $3,000.00 2000 15 Colors 8.5x 11" Exact Index t 25 E 15 Colors 8.5x 11" Exact Index 25 15 Colors 8.5x 11" Exact Index |NO BID 25
Colors 8.5x 11" Springhill Index 25 Colors 8.5x11" | Springhill Index $68.88 25  $1,722.00 2000 Colors 8.5x 11" | Springhill Index $72.00 25 $1,800.00 2500 Colors 8.5x 11" | Springhill Index 25
Colors 8.5x11" Domtar 25 Colors 8.5x11" Domtar l 25 } ‘ Colors 8.5x11" Domtar 25 Colors 8.5x11" Domtar 25
16 Colors 11x17" Exact Index NO BID 10 16 Colors 11x17" Exact Index $96.00 10 $960.00 1000 16 Colors 11x17" Exactindex | | 100 | 16 Colors 11x17" Exact Index |NO BID 10
Colors 11x17" Springhill Index 10 Colors 11x 17" | Springhill Index 10 Colors 11x 17" | Springhill Index $72.00 10 $720.00 1000 Colors 11x 17" | Springhill Index 10
Colors 11x17" Domtar 10 Colors 11x17" Domtar 10 Colors 11x17" Domtar l 10 Colors 11x17" Domtar 10
17 White E 8.5x11" Exact Index ‘ NO BID 15 17 3140 Ib. White; 8.5x11" Exact Index $130.46 15 $1,956.90 2000 17 White 1 8.5x11" | Exact Index NO BID 15 17 White 8.5x11" Exact Index ENO BID 15
‘ | | | % |
18 White | 11x17" Exact Index ‘ NO BID 25 18 |1401b. White| 11x17" Exact Index |NO BID 25 18 White | 11x17" Exact Index |NO BID 25 18 White 11x17" Exact Index |NO BID 25
Neenah Neenah Neenah
Neenah Astrobright Astrobright Astrobright
19 |65Ib. Colors| 8.5x11" |Astrobright Cover| $119.92 30 $3,597.60 2000 19 | 65Ib.Colors| 8.5x11" Cover $110.00 30 $3,300.00 2000 19 |65Ib. Colors| 8.5x 11" Cover NO BID 30 19 65Ib. Colors| 8.5x 11" Cover NO BID 30
Neenah Neenah Neenah
Neenah Astrobright Astrobright Astrobright
20 |651b.Colors| 11x17" | Astrobright Cover| NO BID 15 20 | 65Ib.Colors| 11x17" Cover $110.00 15 $1,650.00 1000 20 651b.Colors| 11x17" Cover NO BID 15 20 65Ib.Colors| 11x17" Cover NO BID 15
21 |20 lb. White ; 8.5x 14" Boise X-9 $58.00 15 $870.00 5000 21 20 lb. White | 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $64.65§ 15 $969.75 5000 21 20 |Ib. White * 8.5x 14" Boise X-9 $64.40 15 $966.00 5000 21 20 |Ib. White| 8.5x 14" Boise X-9 :NO BID 15




20 Ib. White| 8.5x 14" Comet 15 20 |Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Comet 15 20 Ib. White | 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 20 Ib. White| 8.5 x 14" Comet 15
20 lb. White| 8.5x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 lb. White | 8.5x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 |b. White | 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 lb. White | 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15
Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill
20 Ib. White| 8.5x14" |Hammermill Tidal 15 20 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Tidal 15 20 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Tidal $64.85 15 $972.75 5000 20 Ib. White | 8.5x 14" Tidal 15
22 |20 lb. White| 11x17" Boise X-9 $45.00 400 $18,000.00 2500 22 20 Ib. White 11x 17" Boise X-9 $50.85 400 $20,340.00 2500 22 | 201lb. White| 11x17" Boise X-9 $48.85 400 $19,540.00 2500 22 | 20lb. White| 11x17" Boise X-9 NO BID 400
20 Ib. White| 11x17" Comet 400 20 Ib. White | 11x17" Comet 400 20 Ib. White| 11x17" Comet 400 20 Ib. White| 11x17" Comet 400
20 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar Copy 400 20 Ib. White | 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 20 Ib. White | 11x17" Domtar Copy 400 20 Ib. White| 11x17" Domtar Copy 400
Hammermill Hammermill Hammermill
20 Ib. White| 11x17" Hammermill Tidal 400 20 Ib. White 11x17" Tidal 400 20 Ib. White | 11x17" Tidal $51.00 400 $20,400.00 2500 20 Ib. White| 11x17" Tidal 400
23 |20 Ib. White | Hole Punch Boise X-9 $45.00 1o $450.00 5000 23 20 Ib. White | Hole Punch Boise X-9 $53.00 10 $530.00 5000 23 | 20 lb. White |Hole Punch Boise X-9 $48.85 10 $488.50 5000 23 | 20 lb. White |Hole Punch Boise X-9 NO BID 10
20 Ib. White | Hole Punch Comet 10 20 Ib. White | Hole Punch Comet 10 20 Ib. White |Hole Punch Comet 10 20 Ib. White |Hole Punch Comet 10
20 Ib. White | Hole Punch Domtar Copy 10 20 Ib. White | Hole Punch | Domtar Copy 10 20 Ib. White |Hole Punch| Domtar Copy 10 20 Ib. White [Hole Punch| Domtar Copy 10
8.5x11"3 8.5x11"3 Hammermill 8.5x11"3| Hammermill 8.5x11"3 Hammermill
20 |Ib. White | Hole Punch | Hammermill Tidal 10 20 |Ib. White | Hole Punch Tidal 10 20 Ib. White |Hole Punch Tidal $51.00 10 $510.00 5000 20 Ib. White |Hole Punch Tidal 10
Straight Pre- Part Excel One NO BID 15 24 | Straight Pre- Part Excel One } 15 ‘ k 24 |Straight Pre-| 2-Part Excel One NO BID 15 24 | Straight Pre-| 2-Part Excel One NO BID 15
Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand $155.00 15 $2,325.00 5000 Straight Pre-| 2-Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre-| 2-Part NCR Brand 15
Straight Pre- Part Excel One NO BID 15 25 | Straight Pre- Part Excel One [ 15 ‘ g 25 |Straight Pre-| 3-Part Excel One NO BID 15 25 |Straight Pre-| 3-Part Excel One NO BID 15
Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand $174.25 15 $2,613.75 5000 Straight Pre-|  3-Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre-|  3-Part NCR Brand 15
Straight Pre- Part Excel One NO BID 15 26 | Straight Pre- Part Excel One } 15 ‘ § 26 |Straight Pre-| 4-Part Excel One NO BID 15 26 |Straight Pre-| 4-Part Excel One NO BID 15
Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand $186.25 15 $2,793.75 5000 Straight Pre-| 4-Part NCR Brand 15 Straight Pre-|  4-Part NCR Brand 15
Straight Pre- Part Excel One NO BID 5 27 | Straight Pre- Part Excel One t 5‘ ; 27 |Straight Pre-| 5-Part Excel One NO BID 5 27 |Straight Pre-| 5-Part Excel One NO BID 5
Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand 5 Straight Pre- Part NCR Brand $191.50 5 $957.50 5000 Straight Pre-| 5-Part NCR Brand 5 Straight Pre-| 5-Part NCR Brand 5
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Text 8.5x 11" Digital NO BID 10 28 Text 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital $68.90 10 $689.00 2400 28 Text 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital INO BID 10 28 Text 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital INO BID 10
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Cover 8.5x 11" Digital NO BID 25 29 Cover 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital $63.12 25 $1,578.00 1200 29 Cover 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital NO BID 25 29 Cover 8.5x 11" | Premium Digital INO BID 25
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Text 11x17" Digital NO BID 5 30 Text 11x 17" | Premium Digital $84.00 5 $420.00 1500 30 Text 11x 17" | Premium Digital NO BID 5 30 Text 11x 17" | Premium Digital INO BID 5
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Cover 11x17" Digital NO BID 20 31 Cover 11x 17" | Premium Digital $52.54 20 $1,050.80 500 31 Cover 11x 17" | Premium Digital NO BID 20 31 Cover 11x 17" | Premium Digital INO BID 20
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Text 12 x 18" Digital NO BID 5 32 Text 12 x 18" | Premium Digital $64.55 5 $322.75 1000 32 Text 12 x 18" | Premium Digital NO BID 5 32 Text 12 x 18" | Premium Digital /NO BID 5
Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Premium Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling Gloss 100 Ib. Sterling
Cover 12 x 18" Digital NO BID 10 33 Cover 12 x 18" | Premium Digital $60.70 10 $607.00 500 33 Cover 12 x 18" | Premium Digital /NO BID 10 33 Cover 12 x 18" | Premium Digital INO BID 10
LABELS: BRAND: L | LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND:
Labels, Labels, Labels,
34 White 1x25/8" Office Depot $8.00 40 $320.00 3000 34 |Labels, White, 1x25/8" LabelSource $18.00 40 $720.00 34 White 1x25/8" NO BID 40 34 White 1x25/8" Avery $8.00 40 $320.00
Labels, Labels, Labels,
35 White 2x4" Office Depot $9.00 15 $135.00 1000 35 |Labels, White 2x4" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 35 White 2x4" NO BID 15 35 White 2x4" Avery $8.00 15 $120.00
Labels, Labels, Labels,
36 White 31/3x4" Office Depot $8.00 15 $120.00 600 36 |Labels, White, 31/3x4" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 36 White 31/3x4" NO BID 15 36 White 31/3x4" Avery $8.007 15 $120.00
Labels, 21/3x3 21/3x3 Labels, 21/3x3 Labels, 21/3x3
37 White 3/8" Office Depot $5.00 15 $75.00 400 37 |labels, White 3/8" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 37 White 3/8" NO BID 15 37 White 3/8" Compulabel $22.00 15  $330.00
Labels, Labels, 211/16 x Labels, 211/16 x
38 White 211/16x2" Avery $16.00 15 $240.00 375 38 |Labels, White 2 11/16 x 2" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 38 White 2" NO BID 15 38 White 2" Compulabel $14.00 15 $210.00
BRANDS BRANDS BRANDS BRANDS
ACCEPTABLE ACCEPTABLE ACCEPTABLE ACCEPTABLE
(PRINTMASTER (PRINTMASTER (PRINTMASTER (PRINTMASTER
ENVELOPES OR SEVILLE) OR SEVILLE) OR SEVILLE) OR SEVILLE)
B SPECIFYBRAND | ENVELOPES: SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: SPECIFY BRAND
Regular
White, 24 Regular Regular Regular
Ib. White, 24 Ib. White, 24 Ib. White, 24 |b.
39 |(5,000/case)|  63/4" Office Depot  $150.00 5 $750.00 5000 39 | (5,000/case)  63/4" Printmaster $150.000, 5 $750.00 39 |(5,000/case)| 63/4" NO BID 5 39 |(5,000/case)| 6 3/4" NOBID  |NOBID 5
Catalog Catalog Catalog Catalog
Brown, 24 Brown, 24 Brown, 24 Brown, 24
Ib. Ib. Ib. Ib.
40 | (500/case) 6x9" Office Depot $35.00 10 $350.00 500 40 (500/case) 6x9" Printmaster $37.18 10 $371.80 40 | (500/case) 6x9" NO BID 10 40 | (500/case) 6x9" NO BID NO BID 10
Catalog Catalog Catalog
Brown, 28 Catalog Brown, 28 Brown, 28
Ib. Brown, 28 Ib. Ib. Ib.
41 | (500/case) 9x12" Office Depot $65.00 10 $650.00 500 41 (500/case) 9x12" Printmaster $55.00 10 $550.00 41 | (500/case) | 9x12" NO BID 10 41 | (500/case) | 9x12" NO BID NO BID 10
Catalog Catalog Catalog
Brown, 28 Catalog Brown, 28 Brown, 28
Ib. Brown, 28 Ib. Ib. Ib.
42 | (500/case) 10x 13" Office Depot $75.00 10 $750.00 500 42 (500/case) 10x 13" Printmaster $66.50 10 $665.00 42 | (500/case) | 10x 13" NO BID 10 42 | (500/case) | 10x13" NO BID NO BID 10
Catalog
White, 24 Catalog Catalog Catalog
Ib. White, 24 lb. White, 24 lb. White, 24 Ib.
43 | (500/case) 6x9" Office Depot $25.00 40 $1,000.00 500 43 (500/case) 6x9" Printmaster $26.07 40 $1,042.80 43 | (500/case) 6x9" NO BID 40 43 | (500/case) 6x9" NO BID NO BID 40
Catalog
White, 28 Catalog Catalog Catalog
Ib. White, 28 Ib. White, 28 Ib. White, 28 Ib.
44 | (500/case) 9x12" Office Depot $85.00 40 $3,400.00 500 44 (500/case) 9x12" Printmaster $46.15 40  $1,846.00 44 | (500/case) 9x12" NO BID 40 44 | (500/case) 9x12" NO BID NO BID 40
Catalog
White, 28 Catalog Catalog Catalog
Ib. White, 28 Ib. White, 28 Ib. White, 28 Ib.
45 | (500/case) 10x 13" Office Depot $70.00 40 $2,800.00 500 45 (500/case) 10x 13" Printmaster $55.19 40 $2,207.60 45 | (500/case) | 10x13" NO BID 40 45 | (500/case) | 10x 13" NO BID NO BID 40




#9 Regular #9 Regular #9 Regular #9 Regular
White White White White
Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24
Ib. Ib. Ib. Ib.
46 [(2,500/case) 24 |b. Office Depot $70.00 25 $1,750.00 2500 46 | (2,500/case) 24 |b. Printmaster $72.15 25 $1,803.75 46 |(2,500/case) 24 |b. NO BID 25 46 (2,500/case) 24 |b. NO BID NO BID 25
#9 Windows #9 Windows #9 Windows #9 Windows
White White White White
Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24 Hardbox, 24
Ib. Ib. Ib. Ib.
47 |(2,500/case) 24 |b. Office Depot $75.00 25 $1,875.00 2500 47 | (2,500/case) 24 |b. Printmaster $75.08 25 $1,877.00 47 (2,500/case) 24 |b. NO BID 25 47 |(2,500/case) 24 |b. NO BID NO BID 25
| |
TOTAL AWARD GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS $29,944.40 TOTAL AWARD LINDENMEYR MONROE $52,651.45 TOTAL AWARD VERITIV OPERATING COMPANY $2,737.50 TOTAL AWARD OFFICE 8 $780.00

|

NOTES: Lines 34, 36 & 39 resulted in a tie. District made decision to spread the
award amongst the vendors. Lines 40 & 43 are awarded to Lindenmeyr, even
though not the lowest bid. The envelopes that Garvey's bid have the flaps open;

we need envelopes with flaps folded, and that is what Lindenmeyr bid.




