LEGATARCHITECTS

DESIGN | PERFORMANCE | SUSTAINABILITY

November 3, 2022, VIA EMAIL

Mr. Kevin Weisenberger Director of Facility Services Community Unit School District 200 130 West Park Avenue Wheaton, Illinois 60189

Re: 2023 Capital Improvements

Architect's Project Number: 222159.00 Letter of Recommendation for Contract Award

Dear Mr. Weisenberger,

On Tuesday, October 25, at 2:30 p.m. bids were received for the above referenced project in the Board Room of the School Services Center. During the three (3) week bidding period prior to this date, twenty (20) contractors became Bidders of Record. Twelve (12) sealed bids were submitted to the District. The bid opening was conducted by Kevin Weisenberger, CUSD200, Brian O'Keeffe, CUSD200, Paul Pessetti, Legat Architects, Zachary Nichols, Legat Architects and witnessed by thirteen (13) attendees. Refer to the attached Bid Tabulation and Sign-In Sheet.

The base bid project consists of library learning center renovations at Johnson and Whittier Elementary Schools. Alternate bids were also requested for ceiling and lighting replacement at Washington Elementary School and additional ceiling and lighting replacement at Whittier Elementary School as indicated on the Bid Form.

Legat Architects has reviewed the project scope of the apparent low bidder, Reed Construction. Reed has confirmed that they are confident with their bid prices and have included all specified work and allowances. Legat Architects further reviewed the qualifications and references of the low bid contractor and have found no evidence which would disqualify them, from being awarded contracts for the work.

Legat Architects recommends that the Board of Education, Wheaton Warrenville C.U.S.D. 200, consider awarding the Contract for Construction for all facilities, inclusive of the Base Bid (\$1,656,749), and Alternate Bid No. 3 (\$124,195.00), for a total contract amount of \$1,780,944.00, to:

Reed Construction 600 W/ Jackson Blvd., 8th Floor Chicago, IL 60661

All work is to be substantially complete by Friday, August 4, 2023. Alternate Number 1 to renegotiate the date of Substantial Completion and Alternate Number 2, for ceiling and lighting replacement at Washington Elementary School are not being recommended at this time.

Mr. Kevin Weisenberger Community Unit School District 200 Letter of Recommendation for Contract Award November 3, 2022 Page 2 of 2

If you have any questions concerning the bidding of the project, please do not hesitate to call. On behalf of Legat Architects, I look forward to working with the District toward the successful completion of this project.

Sincerely,

Legat Architects, Inc.

Paul J. Pessetti, AIA, LEED AP, BD+C Project Manager

ATTACHMENTS

Bid Tabulation, dated, 10/25/2022 Bid Sign-In Sheet, dated, 10/25/2022



Wheaton Warrenville CUSD200

DESIGN | PERFORMANCE | SUSTAINABILITY **LEGAT**ARCHITECTS

> 2023 Capital Improvements PROJECT TITLE

222159.00

PROJECT NUMBER

October 25, 2022, 2:30 p.m. DATE / TIME:

	Φ	ADDM			BID FORMS						ä	CERTIFICATES	(TES		* REMARKS
BIDDER	_				ALTERNATE BIDS		N	(ħΑ		U		
	NUMBER 1	NUMBER 3	BASE BID	ALT.NO. 1	ALT.NO. 2	ALT.NO. 3	COMPLETIC DATE	BID BOND	.T28U2	Drug Free Workplace	etdgiЯ nomuH Nominal	**Investigatio	Authorizatio Sullo S-no M	Affidavit	** CERTIFICATE IS NOT SIGNED BUT SIGNATURE IS NOT REQUIRED
A Lamp Concrete Contractors															No Bid
April Building Services, Inc.															No Bid
B. Stromberg Constructiuon Co., Inc.															No Bid
Bear Construction	×	×	\$2,027,061.00	\$0.00	\$701,906.00	\$163,704.00		×	×	×	×	×	×	×	
Boller Construction	×	×	\$1,968,700.00	(\$20,000.00)	\$931,400.00	\$117,800.00		×	×	×	×	×	×	×	
Carrol Seating Company															No Bid
Construction, Inc.	×	×	\$2,099,000.00	\$0.00	\$684,000.00	\$63,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	· ·
Constuction Solutions of Illinois, Inc.															No Bid
D. Kersey Construction, Co.															No Bid
Empire Construction Company	×	×	\$2,275,219.00	(\$50,000.00)	\$572,696.00	\$226,325.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	No references included
Integral Construction, Inc.	×	×	\$2,032,000.00	\$0.00	\$738,000.00	\$132,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	>
Kandu Construction, Inc.	×	×	\$2,993,000.00	(\$1,000.00)	\$733,000.00	\$717,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	~
L.J. Morse Construction Company	×	×	\$1,867,000.00	\$0.00	\$687,500.00	\$126,400.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	Second Low
Lite Construction, Inc.	×	×	\$2,345,678.00	\$0.00	\$725,000.00	\$135,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×)
Manusos General Contracting, Inc.	×	×	\$2,295,725.00	\$0.00	\$697,007.00	\$147,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×		X Alt. ADD \$77,000
Midwest Services															No Bid
R.L. Sohol General Contractor	×	×	\$2,187,000.00	\$0.00	\$667,000.00	\$195,000.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	>
Reed Construction Company	×	×	\$1,656,749.00	\$0.00	\$666,794.00	\$124,195.00	-	×	×	×	×	×	×	×	Need Contact Info on References
Tandem Construction, Inc.															No Bid
Toro Construction Group	×	× × ×	\$2,311,902.00	\$0.00	\$275,000.00	\$790,721.00		×	×	×	×	×	×	×	

Alternate No. 1: Renegotiate Liquidated Damages

Alternate No. 2: Provide Ceiling and Lighting Replacement at Washington Elementart School

Alternate No. 3: Provide Celling, Lighting and Sprinkler Head Replacement at Whittier Elementary School

LEGATARCHITECTS

DESIGN | PERFORMANCE | SUSTAINABILITY

Attendance Record

Community Unit School District 200 ORGANIZATION 222159.00 PROJECT NO. 2023 Capital Improvements PROJECT TITLE 2:30 a.m., October 25, 2022 TIME & DATE School Services Center LOCATION **EMAIL ADDRESS** PHONE NUMBER **ORGANIZATION** NAME ppessetti@legat.com 630.710.3540 Legat Architects Paul Pessetti kevin.weisenberger@cusd200.org 815.393.9690 CUSD200 Kevin Weisenberger REEN CONST. James @ Kandu Con struction inc con Estimating abuild integral con construction

Pre-Bid Meeting