
VENDOR: _________________________________________Garvey's Office Products VENDOR: _________________________________________Veritiv Operating Company VENDOR: _________________________________________Lindenmeyr Monroe

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage

Estimated 

Cost

# of 

Sheets 

Per 

Case

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage

Estimated 

Cost

# of 

Sheets 

Per 

Case

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage

Estimated 

Cost

# of 

Sheets 

Per 

Case

1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $63.90 70 $4,473.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors 70 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors 70

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors 70 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $60.70 70 $4,249.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $64.40 70 $4,508.00 5000

2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors $80.00 30 $2,400.00 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors 30 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $65.60 30 $1,968.00 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $69.53 30 $2,085.90 2500

3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $125.90 25 $3,147.50 5000

4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $125.90 10 $1,259.00 2500

5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $64.99 10 $649.90 5000 5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris NO BID 10 5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris 10

60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar $85.50 10 $855.00 5000

6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris $77.99 10 $779.90 2500 6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris NO BID 10 6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris 10

60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar $91.63 10 $916.30 2500

7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $88.00 40 $3,520.00 2000 7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 40 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $48.20 40 $1,928.00 2000 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $55.20 40 $2,208.00 2000

8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $144.00 25 $3,600.00 2000 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 25 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 25

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill $74.82 25 $1,870.50 2000

9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 40 9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 40 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $52.40 40 $2,096.00 1000 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $55.79 40 $2,231.60 1000

10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 20 10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 20 10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 20

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $80.00 20 $1,600.00 2000 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $50.20 20 $1,004.00 2000 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $54.78 20 $1,095.60 2000

11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 10 11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10 11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 10 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill $54.60 10 $546.00 1000 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill $57.99 10 $579.90 1000

12

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $88.00 75 $6,600.00 2000 12 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 75 12

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 75

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 75 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $64.20 75 $4,815.00 2000

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $71.54 75 $5,365.50 2000

13

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30 13 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30 13

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $104.00 30 $3,120.00 1000 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $68.20 30 $2,046.00 1000

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $74.40 30 $2,232.00 1000

14

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $152.00 25 $3,800.00 2000 14

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 25 14

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 25

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $69.20 25 $1,730.00 1000

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $76.62 25 $1,915.50 2000

15

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 10 15

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index 10 15

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index 10

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index $91.80 10 $918.00 1000

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index $72.98 10 $729.80 1000

(Prices must be held firm through June 30, 2024)
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16

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15 16 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15 16

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $87.54 15 $1,313.10 2000

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 15 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 15

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 15

17

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 17 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 17

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 25 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 25

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 25

18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover $119.92 30 $3,597.60 2000 18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 30 18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $99.78 30 $2,993.40 2000

19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover NO BID 15 19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 15 19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $99.78 15 $1,496.70 1000

20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $58.00 15 $870.00 5000 20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 15 20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $65.50 15 $982.50 5000

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Hammermill Tidal 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal $65.20 15 $978.00 5000 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 15

21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $55.00 400 $22,000.00 2500 21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 400 21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $45.78 400 $18,312.00 2500

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Hammermill Tidal 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal $55.30 400 $22,120.00 2500 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 400

22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 $50.90 50 $2,545.00 5000 22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 50 22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 $48.45 50 $2,422.50 5000

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 50

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 50

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Hammermill Tidal 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal $55.30 50 $2,765.00 5000 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal 50

23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One $166.00 15 $2,490.00 5000 23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part Excel One 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $149.15 15 $2,237.25 5000

24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One $188.00 15 $2,820.00 5000 24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part Excel One 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $171.57 15 $2,573.55 5000

25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One $201.00 15 $3,015.00 5000 25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part Excel One 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $179.00 15 $2,685.00 5000

26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One NO BID 5 26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One $204.00 5 $1,020.00 5000 26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part Excel One 5

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 5

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part

Nekoosa 

Universal 5

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $184.80 5 $924.00 5000

27

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 27

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 27

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $64.58 10 $645.80 2400

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11" Futura 10

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11" Futura 10

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11" Futura 10

28

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 25 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 25 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $59.52 25 $1,488.00 1200

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11" Futura 25

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11" Futura 25

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11" Futura 25



29

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $103.12 5 $515.60 2000

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17" Futura 5

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17" Futura 5

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17" Futura 5

30

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 20 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 20 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $49.83 20 $996.60 500

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17" Futura 20

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17" Futura 20

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17" Futura 20

31

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $60.89 5 $304.45 1000

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18" Futura 5

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18" Futura 5

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18" Futura 5

32

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $56.43 10 $564.30 500

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18" Futura 10

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18" Futura 10

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18" Futura 10

LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND:

33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" Office Depot $8.00 40 $320.00 3000 33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" NO BID 40 33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" LabelSource $18.00 40 $720.00 100

34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" Office Depot $9.00 15 $135.00 1000 34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" NO BID 15 34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 100

35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" Office Depot $8.00 15 $120.00 600 35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" NO BID 15 35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 100

36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" Office Depot $5.00 15 $75.00 160 36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" NO BID 15 36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 100

37

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" Avery $15.00 15 $225.00 375 37

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" NO BID 15 37

Labels, 

White

2 11/16 x 

2" LabelSource $18.00 15 $270.00 100

ENVELOPES

: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND

38

Regular 

White, 24 

lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" Office Depot $150.00 5 $750.00 5000 38

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" NO BID 5 38

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" PrintMaster $165.15 5 $825.75 5000

39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $32.00 10 $320.00 500 39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" NO BID 10 39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" PrintMaster $37.18 10 $371.80 500

40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $60.00 10 $600.00 500 40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" NO BID 10 40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" PrintMaster $58.06 10 $580.60 500

41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $75.00 10 $750.00 500 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" NO BID 10 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" PrintMaster $71.47 10 $714.70 500

42

Catalog 

White, 24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $50.00 40 $2,000.00 500 42

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" NO BID 40 42

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" PrintMaster $26.79 40 $1,071.60 500

43

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $45.00 40 $1,800.00 500 43

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" NO BID 40 43

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" PrintMaster $48.77 40 $1,950.80 500

44

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $45.00 40 $1,800.00 500 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" NO BID 40 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" PrintMaster $58.37 40 $2,334.80 500

45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $90.00 25 $2,250.00 2500 45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $76.38 25 $1,909.50 2500

46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $100.00 25 $2,500.00 2500 46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $87.83 25 $2,195.75 2500

$7,844.80 $20,382.00 $52,951.20TOTAL AWARD - GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS TOTAL AWARD - VERITIV OPERATING COMPANY TOTAL AWARD - LINDENMEYR MONROE


