
VENDOR: _________________________________________GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS VENDOR: _________________________________________LINDENMEYR MONROE VENDOR: _________________________________________VERITIV OPERATING COMPANY

Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of 

Sheets Per 

Case

1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 $0.00 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 $0.00 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $64.00 70 $4,480.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors 70 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors 70 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors 70 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $63.50 70 $4,445.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $63.80 70 $4,466.00 5000

2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors $70.00 30 $2,100.00 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors 30 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $67.98 30 $2,039.40 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $68.50 30 $2,055.00 2500

3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $147.90 25 $3,697.50 5000 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 

4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $147.90 10 $1,479.00 2500 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 

5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights $0.00 30 $0.00 NO BID 5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights $127.70 30 $3,831.00 5000 5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights $0.00 30 $0.00 NO BID 

6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $64.99 10 $649.90 5000 6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris 10 $0.00 6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 

60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 $0.00 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar $85.83 10 $858.30 5000 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 $0.00

7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris $111.90 10 $1,119.00 2500 7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris 10 $0.00 7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 

60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 $0.00 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar $91.20 10 $912.00 2500 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 $0.00

8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $71.28 40 $2,851.20 2000 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $46.82 40 $1,872.80 2000 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $47.90 40 $1,916.00 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 $0.00

9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $63.35 25 $1,583.75 2000 9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $68.40 25 $1,710.00 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 $0.00

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 $0.00

10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID 10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $49.83 40 $1,993.20 1000 10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $51.45 40 $2,058.00 1000

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 $0.00

11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $0.00 20 $0.00 NO BID 11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $51.80 20 $1,036.00 2000 11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $52.20 20 $1,044.00 2000

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 20 $0.00

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 $0.00

12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $51.25 10 $512.50 1000 12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $53.20 10 $532.00 1000

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 10 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 10 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 10 $0.00

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

13

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $0.00 75 $0.00 NO BID 13 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $63.75 75 $4,781.25 2000 13

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 75 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 75 $0.00 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 75 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $64.20 75 $4,815.00 2000

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 $0.00 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 $0.00

14

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index $0.00 30 $0.00 NO BID 14 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index $65.00 30 $1,950.00 1000 14

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 30 $0.00 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 30 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $67.90 30 $2,037.00 1000

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 $0.00 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 $0.00
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15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 25 $0.00 15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $70.50 25 $1,762.50 2000

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar $71.74 25 $1,793.50 2000

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 25 $0.00

16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index $70.66 10 $706.60 1000 16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index $72.00 10 $720.00 1000

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

17

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 17 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $91.46 15 $1,371.90 2000 17

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $140.00 15 $2,100.00 2000

18

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 18 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 18

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID

19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover $0.00 30 $0.00 NO BID 19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $113.23 30 $3,396.90 2000 19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $0.00 30 $0.00 NO BID

20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $113.23 15 $1,698.45 1000 20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID

21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $58.00 15 $870.00 5000 21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $61.00 15 $915.00 5000 21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 15 $0.00

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Econosource 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Econosource 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Econosource $58.50 15 $877.50 5000

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Hammermill Tidal 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 15 $0.00

22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $45.00 400 $18,000.00 2500 22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 400 $0.00 22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 400 $0.00

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Econosource 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Econosource 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Econosource $47.00 400 $18,800.00 2500

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Hammermill Tidal 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 400 $0.00

20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Boise Essential 

Copy 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Boise Essential 

Copy $40.05 400 $16,020.00 2500 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Boise Essential 

Copy 400 $0.00

23

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 23

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One 15 $0.00 23

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part Excel One $173.00 15 $2,595.00 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part NCR Brand $163.80 15 $2,457.00 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One 15 $0.00 24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part Excel One $188.70 15 $2,830.50 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part NCR Brand $184.64 15 $2,769.60 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One 15 $0.00 25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part Excel One $200.90 15 $3,013.50 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part NCR Brand $196.92 15 $2,953.80 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One $0.00 5 $0.00 NO BID 26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One 5 $0.00 26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part Excel One $0.00 5 $0.00 NO BID

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part NCR Brand 5 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part NCR Brand $202.50 5 $1,012.50 5000

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part NCR Brand 5 $0.00

27

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 27

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $64.00 10 $640.00 2400 27

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $64.00 10 $640.00 2400

28

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $58.72 25 $1,468.00 1200 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $63.00 25 $1,575.00 1200

29

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 5 $0.00 NO BID 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $78.00 5 $390.00 1500 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $83.00 5 $415.00 1500



30

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 20 $0.00 NO BID 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $49.38 20 $987.60 500 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $40.00 20 $800.00 500

31

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 5 $0.00 NO BID 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $60.50 5 $302.50 1000 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $60.25 5 $301.25 1000

32

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $56.39 10 $563.90 500 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $59.75 10 $597.50 500

LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND:

33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" Office Depot $8.00 40 $320.00 3000 33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID 33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID

34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" Office Depot $9.00 15 $135.00 1000 34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID

35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" Office Depot $8.00 15 $120.00 600 35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID

36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" Office Depot $5.00 15 $75.00 160 36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 36

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID

37

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" Avery $16.00 15 $240.00 375 37

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID 37

Labels, 

White

2 11/16 x 

2" $0.00 15 $0.00 NO BID

ENVELOPES

: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND

38

Regular 

White, 24 

lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" Office Depot $99.00 5 $495.00 5000 38

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" PrintMaster $149.00 5 $745.00 5000 38

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" $0.00 5 $0.00 NO BID

39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $35.00 10 $350.00 500 39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" PrintMaster $37.97 10 $379.70 500 39

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID

40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $65.00 10 $650.00 500 40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" PrintMaster $55.19 10 $551.90 500 40

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID

41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $75.00 10 $750.00 500 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" PrintMaster $67.47 10 $674.70 500 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" $0.00 10 $0.00 NO BID

42

Catalog 

White, 24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $25.00 40 $1,000.00 500 42

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" PrintMaster $27.30 40 $1,092.00 500 42

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID

43

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $20.00 40 $800.00 500 43

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" PrintMaster $48.17 40 $1,926.80 500 43

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID

44

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $44.00 40 $1,760.00 500 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" PrintMaster $55.32 40 $2,212.80 500 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" $0.00 40 $0.00 NO BID

45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $64.00 25 $1,600.00 2500 45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $70.00 25 $1,750.00 2500 45

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID

46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $70.00 25 $1,750.00 2500 46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $75.00 25 $1,875.00 2500 46

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID

47

#10 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $62.50 25 $1,562.50 2500 47

#10 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $67.00 25 $1,675.00 2500 47

#10 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID

48

#10 

Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $70.00 25 $1,750.00 2500 48

#10 

Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. PrintMaster $76.83 25 $1,920.75 2500 48

#10 

Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. $0.00 25 $0.00 NO BID

$13,477.40 $66,808.65 $2,863.75TOTAL AWARD TOTAL AWARD TOTAL AWARD 


