
BID REPLY FORM - PRINTSHOP PAPER - June 1, 2023 

YELLOW HIGHLIGHTS ARE BID PRICES AWARDED

NOTE: REJECT BIDS FOR LINE ITEM #S 39, 40, 47, and 48

VENDOR: _________________________________________VERITIV VENDOR: _________________________________________VENDOR: _________________________________________VENDOR: _________________________________________

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Est 

Usage

Estimated 

Cost

# of 

Sheets 

Per Case

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Item 

# Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Est 

Usage

Estimated 

Cost

# of 

Sheets 

Per Case

1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx NO BIDS 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx NO BID 70 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx NO BIDS 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx $64.50 70 $4,515.00 5000

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $70.15 70 $4,910.50 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors NO BID 70

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $64.35 70 $4,504.50 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors NO BID 70

2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx NO BID 30 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx NO BID 30

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors NO BID 30 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors $72.95 30 $2,188.50 2500

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $69.53 30 $2,085.90 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors NO BID 30

3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $129.06 10 $1,290.60 5000 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $119.92 10 $1,199.20 2000

4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $129.06 10 $1,290.60 2500 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 10

5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris 5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris NO BID 10 5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris 5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $64.99 10 $649.90 5000

60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar $85.50 10 $855.00 5000 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar NO BID 10

6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris 6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris NO BID 10 6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris 6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris $77.99 10 $779.90 2500

60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar $91.62 10 $916.20 2500 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar NO BID 10

7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $67.00 40 $2,680.00 2000 7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $111.92 40 $4,476.80 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $49.24 40 $1,969.60 2000 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill NO BID 40

8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $88.00 25 $2,200.00 2000 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $144.00 25 $3,600.00 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill NO BID 25 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill NO BID 25

9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $69.20 40 $2,768.00 1000 9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $280.00 40 $11,200.00 2000

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $54.81 40 $2,192.40 1000 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill NO BID 40

10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 20 10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 20

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $53.77 20 $1,075.40 2000 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $128.00 20 $2,560.00 2000

11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 10 11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 11 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 10

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill $57.15 10 $571.50 1000 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill NO BID 10

12 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 12 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $90.25 75 $6,768.75 2000 12 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 12 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $88.00 75 $6,600.00 2000

110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $66.27 75 $4,970.25 2000 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index NO BID 75

13 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 13 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index $94.00 30 $2,820.00 1000 13 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 13 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30

110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $69.90 30 $2,097.00 1000 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $116.00 30 $3,480.00 1000

14 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 14 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 25 14 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 14 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 25

110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $71.82 25 $1,795.50 2000 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 110 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index NO BID 25

(Prices must be held firm through December 31, 2023)

LINDENMEYR MUNROE MURNANE GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS



15 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index 15 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 10 15 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index 15 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 10

110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index $93.61 10 $936.10 1000 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 110 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index NO BID 10

16 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 16 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $115.45 15 $1,731.75 2000 16 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 16 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15

140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index NO BID 15 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index NO BID 15

17 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 17 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 17 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 17 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25

140 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index NO BID 25 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index NO BID 25

18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover 18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $102.25 30 $3,067.50 2000 18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover 18 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $96.00 30 $2,880.00 2000

19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover 19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $102.25 15 $1,533.75 1000 19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover 19 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 15

20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $67.12 15 $1,006.80 5000 20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $58.00 15 $870.00 5000

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet NO BID 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet NO BID 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy $66.37 15 $995.55 5000 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy NO BID 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 15

21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $46.91 400 $18,764.00 2500 21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $49.99 400 $19,996.00 2500

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet NO BID 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet NO BID 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy $46.36 400 $18,544.00 2500 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy NO BID 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 400

22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Boise X-9 22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Boise X-9 $52.81 50 $2,640.50 5000 22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Boise X-9 22 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Boise X-9 $50.90 50 $2,545.00 5000

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Comet 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Comet NO BID 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Comet 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Comet NO BID 50

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Domtar Copy 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Domtar Copy $52.12 50 $2,606.00 5000 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Domtar Copy 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch Domtar Copy NO BID 50

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 50 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 

3 Hole 

Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal NO BID 50

23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part Excel One 23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part Excel One NO BID 15 23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-PartExcel One 23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-PartExcel One NO BID 15
Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $141.70 15 $2,125.50 5000

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal NO BID 15

24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part Excel One 24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part Excel One NO BID 15 24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-PartExcel One 24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-PartExcel One NO BID 15
Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $163.00 15 $2,445.00 5000

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal NO BID 15

25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part Excel One 25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part Excel One NO BID 15 25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-PartExcel One 25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-PartExcel One NO BID 15
Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $140.05 15 $2,100.75 5000

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal NO BID 15

26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part Excel One 26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part Excel One NO BID 5 26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-PartExcel One 26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-PartExcel One NO BID 5



Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal NO BID 5

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal NO BID 5

27 Gloss 100 lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 27 Gloss 100 lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital $65.46 10 $654.60 2400 27 Gloss 100 lb. Text8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 27 Gloss 100 lb. Text8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 10

Gloss 100 lb. Text 8.5 x 11" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text 8.5 x 11" Futura NO BID 10 Gloss 100 lb. Text8.5 x 11" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text8.5 x 11" Futura NO BID 10

28 Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 28 Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 59.52 25 $1,488.00 1200 28 Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 28 Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 25

Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11" Futura NO BID 25 Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover8.5 x 11" Futura NO BID 25

29 Gloss 100 lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 29 Gloss 100 lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital $65.90 5 $329.50 1500 29 Gloss 100 lb. Text11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 29 Gloss 100 lb. Text11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 5

Gloss 100 lb. Text 11 x 17" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text 11 x 17" Futura NO BID 5 Gloss 100 lb. Text11 x 17" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text11 x 17" Futura NO BID 5

30 Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 30 Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital $49.15 20 $983.00 500 30 Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 30 Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 20

Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17" Futura NO BID 20 Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover11 x 17" Futura NO BID 20

31 Gloss 100 lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 31 Gloss 100 lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital $60.83 5 $304.15 1000 31 Gloss 100 lb. Text12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 31 Gloss 100 lb. Text12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 5

Gloss 100 lb. Text 12 x 18" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text 12 x 18" Futura NO BID 5 Gloss 100 lb. Text12 x 18" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Text12 x 18" Futura NO BID 5

32 Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 32 Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital $57.43 10 $574.30 500 32 Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital 32 Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium 

Digital NO BID 10

Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18" Futura NO BID 10 Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18" Futura Gloss 100 lb. Cover12 x 18" Futura NO BID 10

LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND:

33 Labels, White 1 x 2 5/8" 33 Labels, White 1 x 2 5/8" Labelsource $18.00 40 $720.00 100 33 Labels, White 1 x 2 5/8" 33 Labels, White 1 x 2 5/8" Office Depot $9.00 40 $360.00 3000

34 Labels, White 2 x 4" 34 Labels, White 2 x 4" Labelsource $18.00 15 $270.00 100 34 Labels, White 2 x 4" 34 Labels, White 2 x 4" Office Depot $9.00 15 $135.00 1000

35 Labels, White 3 1/3 x 4" 35 Labels, White 3 1/3 x 4" Labelsource $18.00 15 $270.00 100 35 Labels, White 3 1/3 x 4" 35 Labels, White 3 1/3 x 4" Office Depot $8.00 15 $120.00 600

36 Labels, White2 1/3 x 3 3/8" 36 Labels, White2 1/3 x 3 3/8" Labelsource $18.00 15 $270.00 100 36 Labels, White 2 1/3 x 3 3/8" 36 Labels, White 2 1/3 x 3 3/8"Office Depot $5.00 15 $75.00 160

37 Labels, White 2 11/16 x 2" 37 Labels, White 2 11/16 x 2" Labelsource $18.00 15 $270.00 100 37 Labels, White 2 11/16 x 2" 37 Labels, White 2 11/16 x 2"Avery $15.00 15 $225.00 375

ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTE

R OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTE

R OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTE

R OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTE

R OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY 

38

Regular White, 

24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" 38

Regular White, 

24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" NO BID 5 38

Regular White, 

24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" 38

Regular White, 

24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" Office Depot $99.00 5 $495.00 5000

39

Regular White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" 39

Regular White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" NO BID 25 39

Regular White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" 39

Regular White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" Office Depot $160.00 25 $4,000.00 5000

40

Window White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" 40

Window White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" NO BID 25 40

Window White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" 40

Window White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 10" Office Depot $200.00 25 $5,000.00 5000

41

Catalog Brown,  

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" 41

Catalog Brown,  

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Printmaster $27.55 10 $275.50 500 41

Catalog Brown,  

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" 41

Catalog Brown,  

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $75.00 10 $750.00 500

42

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" 42

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Printmaster $54.56 10 $545.60 500 42

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" 42

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $80.00 10 $800.00 500

43

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" 43

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Printmaster $71.69 10 $716.90 500 43

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" 43

Catalog Brown, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $80.00 10 $800.00 500

44

Catalog White, 

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" 44

Catalog White, 

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Printmaster $27.55 40 $1,102.00 500 44

Catalog White, 

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" 44

Catalog White, 

24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $36.00 40 $1,440.00 500



45

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" 45

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Printmaster $50.75 40 $2,030.00 500 45

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" 45

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $65.00 40 $2,600.00 500

46

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" 46

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Printmaster $56.35 40 $2,254.00 500 46

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" 46

Catalog White, 

28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $64.00 40 $2,560.00 500

47

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. 47

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 47

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. 47

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $75.00 25 $1,875.00 2500

48

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. 48

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 48

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. 48

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $125.00 25 $3,125.00 2500

$66,717.65 $9,134.80TOTAL BID AWARD LINDENMEYR MUNROE TOTAL BID AWARD GARVEY'S OFFICE PRODUCTS


