
Total Bid 

Award

PRINTSHOP PAPER 
Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Boise Fireworx Colors, 20 lb. 

8 ½” x 11” 70 NO BID #VALUE! 70 NO BID #VALUE! 70 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Domtar Colors, 20 lb. 

8 ½” x 11” 70 $49.75 5,000 $3,482.50 70 $54.75 5,000 $3,832.50 70 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Hammermill Colors, 20 lb.

8 ½” x 11” 70 NO BID #VALUE! 70 NO BID #VALUE! 70 $43.75 5,000 $3,062.50 $3,062.50

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Boise Fireworx Colors, 20 lb.

11” x 17” 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Domtar Colors, 20 lb. 

11” x 17” 30 $52.98 2,500 $1,589.40 30 $58.00 2,500 $1,740.00 30 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Hammermill Colors, 20 lb. 

11” x 17” 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 $47.75 2,500 $1,432.50 $1,432.50

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Neenah Astrobrights, 60 lb.

8 ½” x 11” 40 $78.60 5000 $3,144.00 40 $78.50 5,000 $3,140.00 40 NO BID #VALUE! $3,140.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Neenah Astrobright Text, 60 lb. Colors

11” x 17” 10 $78.60 2500 $786.00 10 $78.50 2,500 $785.00 10 NO BID #VALUE! $785.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Polaris 24 lb. White 

8 ½” x 11”	 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Cougar 60lb.White

8 ½” x 11” 10 $64.25 5,000 $642.50 10 $69.15 5,000 $691.50 10 NO BID #VALUE! $642.50

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Polaris 24 lb. White

11” x 17” 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Cougar 60 lb. White

11” x 17” 10 $67.05 2,500 $670.50 10 $72.00 2,500 $720.00 10 NO BID #VALUE! $670.50

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Vellum Bristol

67 lb. White

8 ½” x 11” 40 $40.34 2,000 $1,613.60 40 NO BID #VALUE! 40 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

BIDDER 1 BIDDER 2 BIDDER 3

Lewis Paper Lindenmeyr Munroe Veritiv Operating Company



Springhill

67 lb. White

8 ½” x 11” 40 NO BID #VALUE! 40 $38.00 2,000 $1,520.00 40 $38.10 2,000 $1,524.00 $1,520.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Vellum Bristol 

67 lb. White

8 ½” x 14” 25 $54.29 2,000 $1,357.25 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill

67 lb. White

8 ½” x 14” 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 $51.00 2,000 $1,275.00 25 $50.00 2,000 $1,250.00 $1,250.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Vellum Bristol

67 lb. White

11” x 17” 40 $42.55 1,000 $1,702.00 40 NO BID #VALUE! 40 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill

67 lb. White

11” x 17”	 40 NO BID #VALUE! 40 $40.00 1,000 $1,600.00 40 $40.10 1,000 $1,604.00 $1,600.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Vellum Bristol

67 lb. Colors

8 ½” x 11” 20 $43.00 2,000 $860.00 20 NO BID #VALUE! 20 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill

67 lb. Colors

8 ½” x 11”	 20 NO BID #VALUE! 20 $40.00 2,000 $800.00 20 $42.10 2,000 $842.00 $800.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Vellum Bristol

67 lb. Colors

11” x 17”	 10 $45.31 1,000 $453.10 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill

67 lb. Colors

11” x 17” 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 $41.00 1,000 $410.00 10 $44.10 1,000 $441.00 $410.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

110 lb. White

8 ½” x 11” 75 $54.60 2,000 $4,095.00 75 NO BID #VALUE! 75 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill

110 lb. White

8 ½” x 11” 75 NO BID #VALUE! 75 $51.00 2,000 $3,825.00 75 $51.40 2,000 $3,855.00 $3,825.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

110 lb. White

11” x 17”	 30 $57.70 1,000 $1,731.00 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 NO BID #VALUE!

OR



Springhill Index

110 lb. White

11” x 17” 30 NO BID #VALUE! 30 $54.00 1,000 $1,620.00 30 $53.40 1,000 $1,602.00 $1,602.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

110 lb. Colors

8 ½” x 11” 25 $58.32 2,000 $1,458.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill Index

110 lb. Colors

8 ½” x 11” 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 $54.00 2,000 $1,350.00 25 $54.40 2,000 $1,360.00 $1,350.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

110 lb. Colors

11” x 17” 10 $61.43 1,000 $614.30 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

OR

Springhill Index

110 lb. Colors

11” x 17” 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 $57.00 1,000 $570.00 10 $56.40 1,000 $564.00 $564.00

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

140 lb. White

8 ½” x 11” 15 $79.24 2,000 $1,188.60 15 $72.00 2,000 $1,080.00 15 NO BID #VALUE! $1,080.00

OR

Springhill Index

140 lb. White

8 ½” x 11”	 15 NO BID #VALUE! 15 NO BID #VALUE! 15 NO BID #VALUE!

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Exact Index

140 lb. White

11” x 17” 25 $95.62 1,000 $2,390.50 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! $2,390.50

OR

Springhill Index

140 lb. White

11” x 17”	 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE!

Brand

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Neenah Astrobright Cover

65 lb. Colors

8 ½” x 11” 30 $62.24 2,000 $1,867.20 30 $63.00 2,000 $1,890.00 30 NO BID #VALUE! $1,867.20

Neenah Astrobright Cover

65 lb. Colors

11” x 17” 15 $62.24 1,000 $933.60 15 $63.00 1,000 $945.00 15 NO BID #VALUE! $933.60

Boise X-9; Comet; Domtar Copy; or 

Hammermill Tidal acceptable.  (Please 

specify brand)

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

20 lb. White 8.5" x 14" 15 NO BID #VALUE! BOISE X-9 15 $52.50 5,000 $787.50 EconoSource/Not specified15 $41.85 5,000 $627.75 $787.50

20 lb. White 11" x 17" 400 NO BID #VALUE! BOISE X-9 400 $39.50 2,500 $15,800.00 EconoSource/Not specified400 $32.90 2,500 $13,160.00 $15,800.00

20 lb. White 8.5" x 11" 3-Hole Pumch 50 NO BID #VALUE! BOISE X-9 50 $40.00 5,000 $2,000.00 EconoSource/Not specified50 $32.90 5,000 $1,645.00 $2,000.00



BRAND

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Excel One Carbonless

8 ½” x 11” Straight Pre-Collated

2-Part 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 $117.44 5,000 $2,936.00

3-Part 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 $132.64 5,000 $3,316.00

4-Part 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 $141.69 5000 $3,542.25
5-Part 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE!

OR 

Nekoosa Universal Carbonless

8 ½” x 11” Straight Pre-Collated

2-Part 25 $97.75 5,000 $2,443.75 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! $2,443.75

3-Part 25 $109.95 5,000 $2,748.75 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! $2,748.75

4-Part 25 $117.60 5,000 $2,940.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! $2,940.00
5-Part 5 $121.75 5,000 $608.75 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE! $608.75

BRAND

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Sterling Premium Digital

Gloss 8 ½ x 11 

100 lb. Text 10 $36.39 2,400 $363.90 10 $52.00 2,400 $520.00 10 $53.12 2,400 $531.20 $363.90

100 lb. Cover 25 $41.94 1,200 $1,048.50 25 $48.00 1,200 $1,200.00 25 $48.99 1,200 $1,224.75 $1,048.50

OR

Futura

Gloss 8 ½ x 11

100 lb. Text 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

100 lb. Cover 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE! 25 NO BID #VALUE!

BRAND

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Sterling Premium Digital

Gloss 11 x 17 

100 lb. Text 5 $55.40 1,500 $277.00 5 $65.00 1,500 $325.00 5 $64.74 1,500 $323.70 $277.00

100 lb. Cover 20 $34.94 500 $698.80 20 $40.00 500 $800.00 20 $40.83 500 $816.60 $698.80

OR

Futura

Gloss  11 x 17 

100 lb. Text 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE!

100 lb. Cover 20 NO BID #VALUE! 20 NO BID #VALUE! 20 NO BID #VALUE!

BRAND

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Sterling Premium Digital

Gloss 12 x 18

100 lb. Text 5 $63.92 1,500 $319.60 5 $49.00 1,000 $245.00 5 $49.80 1,000 $249.00 $319.60

100 lb. Cover 10 $40.27 500 $402.70 10 $46.00 500 $460.00 10 $47.07 500 $470.70 $402.70

OR

Futura

Gloss 12 x 18

100 lb. Text 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE! 5 NO BID #VALUE!

100 lb. Cover 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE! 10 NO BID #VALUE!

LABELS 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case # of sheets/case Total: 

Labelsource Labelsource 



Labels, White, 1” x 2 5/8” 40 $16.26 100 $650.40 40 $18.00 100 $720.00 40 NO BID #VALUE! $650.40

Labels, White, 2” x 4” 25 $16.26 100 $406.50 25 $18.00 100 $450.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! $406.50

Labels, White, 3 1/3” x 4” 25 $16.26 100 $406.50 25 $18.00 100 $450.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! $406.50

Labels, White, 2 1/3” x 3 3/8” 25 $16.26 100 $406.50 25 $18.00 100 $450.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! $406.50

Labels, White, 2 11/16” x 2” 25 $16.26 100 $406.50 25 $18.00 100 $450.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! $406.50

Labels, Clear, 1” x 2 5/8” 25 $54.00 100 $1,350.00 25 $52.00 100 $1,300.00 25 NO BID #VALUE! $1,300.00

ENVELOPES 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case Per case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated Annual 

Usage - Cases per 

year Price per case Per case Total: 

SPECIFY 

BRAND: 

Estimated 

Annual Usage - 

Cases per year Price per case Per case Total: 

6 ¾” Regular White, 24 lb. Printmaster 5 $92.65 5,000 $463.25 LINDENMEYR 5 $105.00 5,000 $525.00 Seville 5 $45.85 5,000 $229.25 $229.25

10” Regular White Hardbox, 24 lb. Printmaster 25 $42.63 2,500 $1,065.75 LINDENMEYR 25 $48.00 2,500 $1,200.00 Seville 25 $48.07 2,500 $1,201.75 $1,065.75

10” Window White Hardbox, 24 lb. Printmaster 25 $48.73 2500 $1,218.25 LINDENMEYR 25 $56.00 2500 $1,400.00 Seville 25 $55.60 2500 $1,390.00 $1,218.25

6” x 9” Catalog Brown, 24 lb. Printmaster 10 $22.65 500 $226.50 LINDENMEYR 10 $23.00 500 $230.00 NA 10 NO BID 500 #VALUE! $226.50

9” x 12” Catalog Brown, 28 lb. Printmaster 10 $33.18 500 $331.80 LINDENMEYR 10 $37.00 500 $370.00 NA 10 NO BID 500 #VALUE! $331.80

10” x 13” Catalog Brown, 28 lb. Printmaster 10 $39.77 500 $397.70 LINDENMEYR 10 $43.00 500 $430.00 NA 10 NO BID 500 #VALUE! $397.70

6” x 9” Catalog White, 24 lb. Printmaster 40 $16.89 500 $675.60 LINDENMEYR 40 $19.00 500 $760.00 Seville 40 $20.43 500 $817.20 $675.60

9” x 12” Catalog White, 28 lb. Printmaster 40 $29.03 500 $1,161.20 LINDENMEYR 40 $33.00 500 $1,320.00 Seville 40 $31.91 500 $1,276.40 $1,161.20

10” x 13” Catalog White, 28 lb. Printmaster 40 $33.65 500 $1,346.00 LINDENMEYR 40 $40.00 500 $1,600.00 Seville 40 $44.04 500 $1,761.60 $1,346.00

#9 Regular White Hardbox, 24 lb. Printmaster 25 $44.90 2500 $1,122.50 LINDENMEYR 25 $48.00 2500 $1,200.00 Seville 25 $45.22 2500 $1,130.50 $1,122.50

#9 Regular White Hardbox, 24 lb. Printmaster 25 $51.00 2500 $1,275.00 LINDENMEYR 25 $56.00 2500 $1,400.00 NA 25 NO BID 2500 #VALUE! $1,275.00

#9 Window, White Digital Hardbox, 24 lb. Printmaster 25 $55.30 2500 $1,382.50 N/A 25 NO BID 2500 #VALUE! NA 25 NO BID 2500 #VALUE! $1,382.50

#10 Window, White Digital Hardbox, 24 

lb. Printmaster 25 $55.30 2500 $1,382.50 LINDENMEYR 25 $62.00 2500 $1,550.00 NA 25 NO BID 2500 #VALUE! $1,382.50

Price to include NEXT DAY DELIVERY 

to: 130 West Park Avenue, Wheaton, 

IL, 60189. Some deliveries may 

require a truck with a lift gate.

TOTALS $32,217.75 $34,397.50 $8,140.25 $74,755.50


