
BID REPLY FORM - PRINTSHOP PAPER - December 5, 2022
(Prices must be held firm through June 30, 2023)

Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price

Estimated 

Usage BRAND 

Estimated 

Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Bid Price

Estimated 

Usage BRAND 

Estimated 

Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Bid Price

Estimated 

Usage BRAND 

Estimated 

Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case

1

Colors, 

20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 $0.00 70 $0.00 70Colors, 

20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $61.00 70 $4,270.00 5,000 $70.00 70 $4,900.00 5,000 70Colors, 

20lb. 8.5 x 11" Hammermill Colors 70 $0.00 $64.37 70 $4,505.90 5,000 70

2

Colors, 

20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00 30 $0.00 30Colors, 

20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors $74.95 30 $2,248.50 2,500 $75.31 30 $2,259.30 2,500 30Colors, 

20lb. 11 x 17" Hammermill Colors 30 $0.00 $69.53 30 $2,085.90 2,500 30

3

60 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Neenah Astrobrights $14.99 $0.00 250/pack $129.06 40 $5,162.40 5,000

4

60 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Neenah Astrobrights NO BID 10 $129.06 10 $1,290.60 2,500 10

5 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $64.99 10 $649.90 4,000 NO BID 10 10

60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 $0.00 10 $0.00 10

6 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris $65.99 10 $659.90 2,000 10 $0.00 10

60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 $0.00 $83.50 10 $835.00 5,000 10

7 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $104.00 40 $4,160.00 2,000 $63.15 40 COUGAR??? $2,526.00 2000? 40

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 40 $0.00 $52.54 40 $2,101.60 2000? 40

8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $112.00 25 $2,800.00 2,000 NO BID 25 25

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill Index 25 $0.00 25 $0.00 25

9 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $200.00 40 $8,000.00 2,000 40 $0.00 40

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 40 $0.00 $52.30 40 $2,092.00 1,000 40

10

67 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $104.00 20 $2,080.00 2,000 20 $0.00 2067 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 20 $0.00 $53.77 20 $1,075.40 2,000 20

11

67 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10 $0.00 10 $0.00 1067 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index $99.00 10 $990.00 1,000 $60.62 10 $606.20 1,000 10

12

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $72.00 75 $5,400.00 2,000 $76.95 75 $5,771.25 2,000 75

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 75 $0.00 $65.70 75 $4,927.50 2,000 75

13

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index $120.00 30 $3,600.00 1,000 $80.33 30 $2,409.90 1,000 30

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 30 $0.00 $69.78 30 $2,093.40 1,000 30

Garvey's Office Products LINDENMEYR MONROE VERITIV - NO BIDS



14

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $72.00 25 $1,800.00 2,000 25 $0.00 25

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25 $0.00 $71.82 25 $1,795.50 2,000 25

15

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index 10 $0.00 10 $0.00 10

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index $120.00 10 $1,200.00 1,000 $71.82 10 $718.20 1,000 10

16

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15 NO BID 15 15

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 15 $0.00 15 $0.00 15

17

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 NO BID 25 25

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 25 $0.00 25 $0.00 25

18

65 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $152.00 30 $4,560.00 2,000 $102.37 30 $3,071.10 2,000 30

19

65 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 15 $102.37 15 $1,535.55 1,000 15

20 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $61.25 15 $918.75 5,000 $68.50 15 $1,027.50 5,000 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 $0.00 NO BID 15 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00 $66.37 15 $995.55 5,000 15

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Hammermill Tidal 15 $0.00 NO BID 15 15

21 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $52.25 400 $20,900.00 2,500 400 $0.00 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 $0.00 400 $0.00 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00 $52.15 400 $20,860.00 2,500 400

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Hammermill Tidal 400 $0.00 400 $0.00 400

22 20 lb. White8.5 x 11" 3 Hole PunchBoise X-9 $49.90 50 $2,495.00 5,000 50 $0.00 50

20 lb. White8.5 x 11" 3 Hole Punch Comet 50 $0.00 50 $0.00 50

20 lb. White8.5 x 11" 3 Hole PunchDomtar Copy 50 $0.00 $52.15 50 $2,607.50 5,000 50

20 lb. White8.5 x 11" 3 Hole PunchHammermill Tidal 50 $0.00 50 $0.00 50

23

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part Excel One 15 $0.00 15 $0.00 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 2-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $195.00 15 $2,925.00 $141.70 15 $2,125.50 5,000 15

24

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part Excel One 15 $0.00 15 $0.00 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 3-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $155.00 15 $2,325.00 $159.50 15 $2,392.50 5,000 15



25

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part Excel One 15 $0.00 15 $0.00 15

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 4-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $155.00 15 $2,325.00 $170.50 15 $2,557.50 5,000 15

26

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part Excel One 5 $0.00 5 $0.00 5

Carbonless 

Reverse Pre-

Collated 8.5 x 11" - 5-Part

Nekoosa 

Universal $155.00 5 $775.00 $176.50 5 $882.50 5,000 5

27

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 10 $56.18 10 $561.80 2,400 10

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11" Futura 10 $0.00 10 $0.00 10

28

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 25 $57.84 25 $1,446.00 1,200 25

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11" Futura 25 $0.00 25 $0.00 25

29

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 5 $76.81 5 $384.05 1,500 5

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17" Futura 5 $0.00 5 $0.00 5

30

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 20 $49.55 20 $991.00 500 20

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17" Futura 20 $0.00 20 $0.00 20

31

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 5 $58.55 5 $292.75 1,000 5

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18" Futura 5 $0.00 5 $0.00 5

32

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital NO BID 10 $56.43 10 $564.30 500 10

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18" Futura 10 $0.00 10 $0.00 10

LABELS: BRAND: Office Depot LABELSOURCE

33

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" $8.99 40 OF $359.60 2,000 $21.00 40 $840.00 100 40

34

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" $8.99 15 $134.85 1,000 $21.00 15 $315.00 100 15

35

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" $7.99 15 $119.85 600 $21.00 15 $315.00 100 15

36

Labels, 

White 2 1/3 x 3 3/8" $5.66 15 $84.90 400 $21.00 15 $315.00 100 15

37

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" $15.00 15 AVERY $225.00 375 $21.00 15 $315.00 100 15



ENVELOPES

:

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND Office Depot $0.00

38

Regular 

White, 24 

lb. 

(5,000/case

) 6 3/4" $99.00 5 $495.00 5,000 $130.00 5 PRINTMASTER $650.00 5,000 5

39

Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case

) 10" $67.15 25 $1,678.75 2,500 $79.75 25 PRINTMASTER $1,993.75 2,500 25

40

Window 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case

) 10" $94.95 25 $2,373.75 2,500 $93.43 25 PRINTMASTER $2,335.75 2,500 25

41

Catalog 

Brown, 24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" $53.05 10 $530.50 500 NO BID 10 10

42

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" $65.75 10 $657.50 500 NO BID 10 10

43

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" $65.75 10 $657.50 500 $65.00 10 PRINTMASTER $650.00 500 10

44

Catalog 

White, 24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" $37.62 40 $1,504.80 500 $27.55 40 PRINTMASTER $1,102.00 500 40

45

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" $58.00 40 $2,320.00 500 $47.87 40 PRINTMASTER $1,914.80 500 40

46

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" $58.00 40 $2,320.00 500 $60.96 40 PRINTMASTER $2,438.40 500 40

47

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case

) 24 lb. $74.95 25 $1,873.75 2,500 $78.82 25 PRINTMASTER $1,970.50 2,500 25



48

#9 

Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case

) 24 lb. $79.95 25 $1,998.75 2,500 $88.00 25 PRINTMASTER $2,200.00 2,500 25

$27,697.00 $61,783.30


