
VENDOR: _________________________________________Garvey's Office Products VENDOR: _________________________________________Veritiv Operating Company VENDOR: _________________________________________Lindenmeyr Monroe

Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of Sheets 

Per Case Item # Item Size Brand Bid Price 

Estimated 

Usage Estimated Cost

# of 

Sheets Per 

Case

1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70 1 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Boise Fireworx 70

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $65.00 70 $4,550.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors $62.50 70 $4,375.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11" Domtar Colors 70 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors 70 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors 70 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 8.5 x 11"

Hammermill 

Colors $62.40 70 $4,368.00 5000

2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00 2 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Boise Fireworx 30 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors $70.00 30 $2,100.00 2500 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30 $0.00 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17" Domtar Colors 30 $0.00

Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors 30 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $62.50 30 $1,875.00 5000 Colors, 20lb. 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Colors $67.28 30 $2,018.40 2500

3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 25 3 60 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $144.95 25 $3,623.75 5000

4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights NO BID 10 4 60 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobrights $144.95 10 $1,449.50 2500

5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights NO BID 30 5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights NO BID 30 5 50 lb Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Brights $127.79 30 $3,833.70 5000

6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris $77.95 10 $779.50 2500 6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris NO BID 10 6 24 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Polaris 10 $0.00

60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar 10 $0.00 60 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Cougar $82.40 10 $824.00 5000

7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris NO BID 10 7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris NO BID 10 7 24 lb. White 11 x 17" Polaris 10 $0.00

60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar 10 $0.00 60 lb. White 11 x 17" Cougar $86.94 10 $869.40 2500

8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $80.00 40 $3,200.00 2000 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00 8 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill 40 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $47.90 40 $1,916.00 2000 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill $48.48 40 $1,939.20 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 40 $0.00

9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 25 9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 25 $0.00 9 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $95.78 25 $2,394.50 2000

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill $64.30 25 $1,607.50 2000 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Springhill 25 $0.00

67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 $0.00 67 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar 25 $0.00

10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 40 10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00 10 67 lb. White 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 40 $0.00

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill 40 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $50.60 40 $2,024.00 1000 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill $51.00 40 $2,040.00 1000

67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 $0.00 67 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 40 $0.00

11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 20 11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $50.60 20 $1,012.00 2000 11 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 20 $0.00

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $50.60 20 $1,012.00 2000 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill $51.62 20 $1,032.40 2000

67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 20 $0.00

12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol NO BID 10 12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol $54.00 10 $540.00 1000 12 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Exact Vellum 

Bristol 10 $0.00

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill 10 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill $54.00 10 $540.00 1000 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Springhill $54.00 10 $540.00 1000

67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00 67 lb. Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

13

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 75 13 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 75 $0.00 13

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 75 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 75 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $63.90 75 $4,792.50 2000

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $64.00 75 $4,800.00 2000

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 110 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Domtar 75 $0.00

14

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 30 14 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30 $0.00 14

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index 30 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index 30 $0.00 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $66.90 30 $2,007.00 1000

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Springhill Index $68.00 30 $2,040.00 1000

(Prices must be held firm through  June 30, 2025)
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110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 110 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 $0.00

110 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Domtar 30 $0.00

15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 25 15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $68.00 25 $1,700.00 2000 15

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Exact Index 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Springhill Index $68.00 25 $1,700.00 2000

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 25

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 25 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 8.5 x 11" Domtar 25 $0.00

16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 10 16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index $71.00 10 $710.00 1000 16

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Exact Index $75.25 10 $752.50 1000

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Springhill Index 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

110 lb. 

Colors 11 x 17" Domtar 10 $0.00

17

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15 17 140 lb. White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index NO BID 15 17

140 lb. 

White 8.5 x 11" Exact Index $130.00 15 $1,950.00 2000

18

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 18 140 lb. White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25 18

140 lb. 

White 11 x 17" Exact Index NO BID 25

19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover NO BID 30 19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 30 19 65 lb. Colors 8.5 x 11"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $115.00 30 $3,450.00 2000

20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright Cover NO BID 15 20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover NO BID 15 20 65 lb. Colors 11 x 17"

Neenah 

Astrobright 

Cover $115.00 15 $1,725.00 1000

21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $58.00 15 $870.00 5000 21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 15 $0.00 21 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Boise X-9 $63.94 15 $959.10 5000

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Comet 15 $0.00

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Domtar Copy 15 $0.00

20 lb. White 8.5 x 14" Hammermill Tidal 15 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal $77.00 15 $1,155.00 5000 20 lb. White 8.5 x 14"

Hammermill 

Tidal 15 $0.00

22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $45.00 400 $18,000.00?? 2500 per Jeebs 22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 400 $0.00 22 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Boise X-9 $47.48 400 $18,992.00 2500

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Comet 400 $0.00

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00 20 lb. White 11 x 17" Domtar Copy 400 $0.00

20 lb. White 11 x 17" Hammermill Tidal 400 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal $57.00 400 $22,800.00 2500 20 lb. White 11 x 17"

Hammermill 

Tidal 400 $0.00

23 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 $45.00 10 $450.00 5000 23 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 10 $0.00 23 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Boise X-9 $50.24 10 $502.40 5000

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 10 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 10 $0.00 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Comet 10 $0.00

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 10 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 10 $0.00 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Domtar Copy 10 $0.00

20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch Hammermill Tidal 10 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal $61.00 10 $610.00 5000 20 lb. White

8.5 x 11" 3 

Hole Punch

Hammermill 

Tidal 10 $0.00

24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part Excel One $171.00 15 $2,565.00 5000 24

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part Excel One 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part NCR Brand 15

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 2-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

2-Part NCR Brand $165.75 15 $2,486.25 5000

25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part Excel One $185.00 15 $2,775.00 5000 25

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part Excel One 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part NCR Brand 15

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 3-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

3-Part NCR Brand $186.88 15 $2,803.20 5000

26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One NO BID 15 26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part Excel One $197.00 15 $2,955.00 5000 26

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part Excel One 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part NCR Brand 15

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 4-

Part NCR Brand 15 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

4-Part NCR Brand $199.25 15 $2,988.75 5000

27

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One NO BID 5 27

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part Excel One $202.00 5 $1,010.00 5000 27

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part Excel One 5 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part NCR Brand 5

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 5-

Part NCR Brand 5 $0.00

Carbonless 

Straight Pre-

Collated

8.5 x 11" - 

5-Part NCR Brand $204.95 5 $1,024.75 5000



28

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $66.00 10 $660.00 2400 28

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $68.90 10 $689.00 2400

29

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 25 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 25 29

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 8.5 x 11"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $63.12 25 $1,578.00 1200

0

30

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $81.00 5 $405.00 1500 30

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $84.00 5 $420.00 1500

31

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 20 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $40.00 20 $800.00 500 31

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 11 x 17"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $79.00 20 $1,580.00 500

32

Gloss 100 

lb. Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 5 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $62.00 5 $310.00 1000 32

Gloss 100 lb. 

Text 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $64.55 5 $322.75 1000

33

Gloss 100 

lb. Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital NO BID 10 33

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling Premium 

Digital $58.00 10 $580.00 500 33

Gloss 100 lb. 

Cover 12 x 18"

Sterling 

Premium Digital $60.70 10 $607.00 500

LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: LABELS: BRAND: $0.00

34

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" Office Depot $8.00 40 $320.00 3000 34

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" Showcase $18.80 40 $752.00 34

Labels, 

White 1 x 2 5/8" NO BID 40 $0.00

35

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" Office Depot $9.00 15 $135.00 1000 35

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" Showcase $18.80 15 $282.00 35

Labels, 

White 2 x 4" NO BID 15 $0.00

36

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" Office Depot $8.00 15 $120.00 600 36

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" Showcase $18.80 15 $282.00 36

Labels, 

White 3 1/3 x 4" NO BID 15 $0.00

37

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" Office Depot $5.00 15 $75.00 400 37

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" Showcase $14.40 15 $216.00 37

Labels, 

White

2 1/3 x 3 

3/8" NO BID 15 $0.00

38

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" Avery $16.00 15 $240.00 375 38

Labels, 

White 2 11/16 x 2" NO BID 15 $0.00 38

Labels, 

White

2 11/16 x 

2" NO BID 15 $0.00

ENVELOPES

: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND ENVELOPES: 

BRANDS 

ACCEPTABLE 

(PRINTMASTER 

OR SEVILLE) 

SPECIFY BRAND $0.00

39

Regular 

White, 24 

lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" Office Depot $150.00 5 $750.00 5000 39

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" NO BID 5 $0.00 39

Regular 

White, 24 lb. 

(5,000/case) 6 3/4" Printmaster $150.00 5 $750.00 5000

40

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $35.00 10 $350.00 500 40

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" NO BID 10 $0.00 40

Catalog 

Brown,  24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Printmaster $37.18 10 $371.80 500

41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $65.00 10 $650.00 500 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" NO BID 10 $0.00 41

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Printmaster $55.64 10 $556.40 500

42

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $75.00 10 $750.00 500 42

Catalog 

Brown, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" NO BID 10 $0.00 42

Catalog 

Brown, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Printmaster $69.68 10 $696.80 500

43

Catalog 

White, 24 

lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Office Depot $25.00 40 $1,000.00 500 43

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" NO BID 40 $0.00 43

Catalog 

White, 24 lb. 

(500/case) 6 x 9" Printmaster $25.00 40 $1,000.00 500

44

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Office Depot $85.00 40 $3,400.00 500 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" NO BID 40 $0.00 44

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 9 x 12" Printmaster $46.15 40 $1,846.00 500

45

Catalog 

White, 28 

lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Office Depot $70.00 40 $2,800.00 500 45

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" NO BID 40 $0.00 45

Catalog 

White, 28 lb. 

(500/case) 10 x 13" Printmaster $55.19 40 $2,207.60 500

46

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $70.00 25 $1,750.00 2500 46

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 $0.00 46

#9 Regular 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Printmaster $72.15 25 $1,803.75 2500

47

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Office Depot $75.00 25 $1,875.00 2500 47

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. NO BID 25 $0.00 47

#9 Windows 

White 

Hardbox, 24 

lb. 

(2,500/case) 24 lb. Printmaster $86.00 25 $2,150.00 2500

$25,714.50 $25,979.00 $33,340.40TOTAL AWARD TOTAL AWARD TOTAL AWARD 


